
COUNTY OF ULSTER 
JEN METZGER 
County Executive 

 
 
 
 
 

ULSTER COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES 
 

EDWARD M. JORDAN 
Director of General Services 

 

CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION 
(updated 9/10/2025) 

 
Title: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 
 
BID NUMBER: RFB-UC24-047 
 
Contract Period: JANUARY 30, 2025 – JANUARY 31, 2026 
 
Authorized Users: ALL 
 
View Specifications at:  http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/ 
 
 

Submit Inquiries to: 
Name:  FRANCES WU, Principal Buyer  
 
Phone: 845-340-3408 
 
Fax: 845-340-3434 
 
Email: frwu@co.ulster.ny.us 

 
If you intend to Piggyback off of this bid please contact Buyer first. 
 
 

BID DESCRIPTION 
 
The purpose of this bid is to establish pricing for the purchase of janitorial supplies by various Ulster 

County Departments and others authorized by law.  
 

NYS Preferred Source and GSA options have been provided for items not awarded or when the 
preferred source option meets Preferred Source price standards (up to 15% above the awarded 
vendor price), based on available prices as of January 1, 2025. Please note for Corcraft “inside 

delivery” pricing was used. (Loading dock pricing is shown and typically $10 less). Preferred Source 
and GSA options are indicated by ** on this list and are not awarded as part of this RFB. For more 

information about use of Preferred Sources go to 
https://ogs.ny.gov/system/files/documents/2022/09/list-of-preferred-source-offerings.pdf and 

https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement/nys-procurement-bulletin-preferred-source-guidelines. 



 

AWARDED SUPPLIERS (updated 9/10/2025) 
 
 

SUPPLIER 
SUPPLIER 

INFORMATION 
CONTACT INFO 

ARAMSCO 
Contract #B24-047A 

Deanna McGee – PO’s 
Keith Sult – Bids 

11 Harding St. 
Middletown, NY 10940 

Email: eamorders@aramsco.com 
ksult@aramsco.com    

 Phone: (845) 346-4700      
 Fax: (845) 346-4717     

CAROLINAS PAPER 
SUPPLY 

Contract #B24-047B 

Gregory Alford 
701 Rainbow Drive 

Kannapolis,  NC 28081 

Email: 
carolinaspapersupply@gmail.com 

 Phone: (704) 449-0797 

HEAD TO HEELS 
(Agni Enterprises) 

Contract #B24-047C 

Subbarayan Pochi 
9021 SW 94th Street, Unit 510 

Miami, FL 33176 

Email: cservice@headtoheels.net 
 Phone: (305) 712-6653 

Fax: (888) 592-3667 

HILL & MARKES 
Contract #B24-047D 

Angie Richards – sales 
Customer Service - Bids 

1997 State Hwy 
Amsterdam, NY 12010 

Email: arichards@hillnmarkes.com 
info@hillnmarkes.com 
 Phone: (518) 774-4447   

 Fax: (518) 842-1207      

IMPERIAL DADE 
Contract  #B24-047E 

MJ Harkins 
255 Route 1&9 

Jersey City, NJ 07306 

Email: mjharkins@imperialdade.com 
 Phone: (914) 403-6275   

 Fax: (201) 437-7081     

INTERBORO 
Contract  #B24-047F 

Abraham Jeremias 
114 Bracken Road 

Montgomery, NY 12529 

abraham@interboropackaging.com 
 Phone: (845) 782-6800 

 Fax: (845) 781-2450 

UNITED SALES 
Contract #B24-047G 

Rachel Brach 
5902 14th Ave., Unit 107 

Brooklyn, NY 11219 

Email: bids@unitedsalesusa.com 
 Phone: (718) 709-5900 

 Fax: (718) 709-7705 

WB MASON 
Contract #B24-047H 

Leanne Wood 
22 Veteran’s Lane 

Plattsburgh, NY 12901 

Email: Leanne.wood@wbmason.com  
Phone: (508) 436-5722 

Fax: (518) 561-4584 

 
 
 

PREFERRED SOURCES and GSA Contractor 
 
 

SUPPLIER 
SUPPLIER 

INFORMATION 
CONTACT INFO 

CORCRAFT CORCRAFT 
www.corcraft.ny.gov 

 Phone: (800) 436-6321 x2605      
 Fax: (518) 436-6007     

NYS PROGRAM FOR 
NEW YORKERS WHO 

ARE BLIND 
NYSPSP 

www.nyspsp.org 
 Phone: (800) 421-9010 

 Fax: (518) 456-3587 

NYS INDUSTRIES FOR 
THE DISABLED 

NYSID 
www.nysid.org 

 Phone: (518) 463-9706 
 Fax: (518) 463-9708 

WEXFORD LABS 
Liz Bouren 

325 Leffingwell Avenue 
Kirkwood, MO 63122 

Email: orders@wexfordlabs.com  
Phone: (314) 966-4134 



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

A.1 WHITE VINEGAR, GALLON Uline Uline S-25034 S-25034 GAL 6  $            16.00 
CAROLINAS PAPER 

SUPPLY

A.2 PEROXIDE, QUART CUM 1000035170 QT (32 OZ) 12  $            71.16 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

A.3 PEROXIDE, GALLON HDX A0013 GAL 4  $            68.28 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

A.4 BAKING SODA, 32OZ CDC3320001140 QT (32 OZ) 12  $            48.20 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

A.5
ECO-ME WOOD POLISH LEMON FRESH, 16 

OZ (NO SUBS)
Eco-Me Eco-Me ECOM-WPLF16 ECOM-WPLF16 16 OZ 12  $          110.00 

CAROLINAS PAPER 
SUPPLY

A.7
PURELL PROFESSIONAL SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT, GALLON GOJ343204 (NO 
SUBS)

GOJO 
Industries

Purell 3432-04 GOJ434204 GAL 4  $            35.99 WB MASON

A.8
PURELL PROFESSIONAL SURFACE RTU 

SPRAY, 
QUART  GOJ334206 (NO SUBS)

GOJO 
Industries

Purell 3342-06 GOJ334206 QT (32 OZ) 6  $            22.89 WB MASON

A.9
LYSOL HYDROGEN PEROXIDE MULTI-

PURPOSE CLEANER 19200-89289 (NO SUBS) 

Reckitt 
Benckiser 

Group
Lysol 19200-89289 RAC89289CT QT (32 OZ) 9  $            50.82 IMPERIAL BAG

A.10
PURELL PROFESSIONAL FOOD SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT, GALLON GOJ434104 (NO 
SUBS)

GOJO 
Industries

Purell 4341-04 GOJ434104 GAL 4  $            35.99 WB MASON

A.11
PURELL PROFESSIONAL FOOD SURFACE RTU 

SPRAY, QUART  GOJ334106  (NO SUBS)
GOJO 

Industries
Purell  3341-06 GOJ334106CT QT (32 OZ) 6  $            22.89 WB MASON

A.13
CREAM MULTI-SURFACE CLEANSER, 

WASHROOM CLEANSER
 ENVIRO SOLUTIONS ES53 (NO SUBS)

Enviro 
Solution

Washroom 
Cleanser

ES53 ES536CLEANSER QT (32 OZ) 6  $            38.50 IMPERIAL BAG

A.14 CALCIUM, LIME, AND RUST REMOVER JEL CLR BATH32PROEA JELBATH32PROEA QT (32 OZ) 1  $               7.54 WB MASON

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 1 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

A.15 GRANITE AND STONE CLEANER Weiman Weiman WMN 109 WMN 109 24 OZ 6  $            45.00 
CAROLINAS PAPER 

SUPPLY

A.16 WHITEBOARD CLEANER
Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PL98696 EFPPL98696 QT (32 OZ) 6  $            26.82 WB MASON

A.17** GLASS CLEANER -GALLON Corcraft Green Line U01GRGCRTU004 U01GRGCRTU004 GAL 4
 $21.90

$11.90 Dock 
CORCRAFT**

A.17 GLASS CLEANER -GALLON Spartan
Glass 

Cleaner
383504 3835 GAL 4  $            42.00 IMPERIAL BAG

A.18**  GLASS CLEANER - SPRAY (NON-AEROSOL) Corcraft Green Line U01GRGCRTU32 U01GRGCRTU32 QT (32 OZ) 12
 $32.50

$22.50 Dock 
CORCRAFT**

A.19 URINE DIGESTER AND ODOR NEUTRALIZER Betco Push 1331200BTC 1331200BTC QT (32 OZ) 12  $            81.00 
CAROLINAS PAPER 

SUPPLY

A.24
SIMONIZ GREENSCENE

HEAVY DUTY LIQUID DEGREASER 
CONCENTRATE G1165004 (NO SUBS)

Simoniz USA Simoniz G1165005 G1165005 GAL 4  $            76.00 
CAROLINAS PAPER 

SUPPLY

A.25
SIMPLE GREEN INDUSTRIAL CLEANER AND 

DEGREASER SMP13005CT (NO SUBS)
Sunshine 

Makers, Inc.
Simple 
Green

 SMP13005CT SG13005 GAL 6  $            68.40 IMPERIAL BAG

A.28 CARPET SPOT CLEANER DIVERSEY DIVERSEY 101109763 DIV101109763 QT (32 OZ) 12  $            49.92 HILL & MARKES

A.30 NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER - 1 GALLON 
National 
Chemical 

Labs

National 
Chemical 

Labs
405029 NCL405029 GAL 4  $            34.48 WB MASON

A.31
NCL BARE BONES  LIQUIFYING STRIPPER

GALLON NCL105829 (NO SUBS)

National 
Chemical 

Labs

National 
Chemical 

Labs
NCL105829 NCL105829 GAL 4  $            52.93 WB MASON

A.32
NCL IMPRESSIONS FLOOR-FINISH
GALLON NCL055029 (NO SUBS)

National 
Chemical 

Labs

National 
Chemical 

Labs
NCL055029 NCL055029 GAL 4  $            59.07 WB MASON

A.35**
NON-CHLORINE LAUNDRY BLEACH - 1 

GALLON
Corcraft Green Line U01GRXB004 U01GRXB004 GAL 4

 $43.50
$33.50 Dock 

CORCRAFT**

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 2 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

A.36
INSECT REPELLENT DEEP WOODS OFF 

(w/DEET, NON-AEROSOL) 6OZ
SC JOHNSON

OFF! 
FAMILY 
CARE

654458 SJN654458 6 OZ BOTTLE 12  $            95.04 HILL & MARKES

A.37
DISINFECTING WIPES SMALL

CANISTER    CLOROX ECOCLEAN 75 CT 60605 
(NO SUBS)

The Clorox 
Company

Clorox 
EcoClean

60605 CLOX60605 Canister of 75 6  $            33.73 IMPERIAL BAG

A.38**
DISINFECTING WIPES BUCKET

(LARGE CANISTER)  
Wexford Labs

Purefexion 
Disinfectin

g Wipes
3230C--160-CS 3230C-160-CS

Canister of 
160

12  $          118.15 
WEXFORD LABS**

GS-07F-057AA

A.40
PURELL HEALTHCARE SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT RTU SPRAY, 
QUART  GOJ334006 (NO SUBS)

GOJO 
Industries

Purell 3340-06 GOJO334006 QT 6  $            40.02 IMPERIAL BAG

B.1 SQUEEGIE,12" WINDOW Janico Squeegie 4810 BOWLSWAB EA 1  $               5.59 IMPERIAL BAG

B.2 TELESCOPING HANDLE FOR SQUEEGIE Rubbermaid
Hygen Mop 

Handle
FGQ75500YL00 OCQ755 EA 1  $            15.18 IMPERIAL BAG

B.3 MR CLEAN MAGIC ERASER (NO SUBS)
Procter & 
Gamble

Mr. Clean 79009 PNG79009 BOX OF 6 6  $            34.92 HILL & MARKES

B.4
PUMIE 12 SCOURING STICK, GRAY PUMICE, 

5 ¾ X ¾ X 11/4 (NO SUBS)
U.S. Pumice 

Company
Pumie 559004 PUM12B EA 1  $               2.25 IMPERIAL BAG

B.5
SWIFFER DUSTERS HEAVY DUTY 6 FT. SUPER 

EXTENDER STARTER KIT (NO SUBS) 
Procter & 
Gamble

Swiffer 37000773269 82074B EA 1  $               9.99 IMPERIAL BAG

B.6
SWIFFER DUSTERS HEAVY DUTY 6 FT. SUPER 

EXTENDER REFILLS (OR EQUIV) MUST FIT 
Swiffer 77326

Procter & 
Gamble

Swiffer 37000214595 PG21459 BOX OF 10 4  $            42.00 IMPERIAL BAG

B.7 MEDIUM DUTY SCRUB PADS 9X6 
Imperial 

Dade

Victoria 
Bay Med 

Duty Scour 
7100203200 VB96MSP EA 20  $               6.40 IMPERIAL BAG

B.8 HEAVY DUTY SCRUB PADS 9X6 Americo Brightline 510163 16048961 EA 60  $            21.60 ARAMSCO

Category B: Janitorial Supplies and Equipment

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 3 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.9 MED-HEAVY DUTY 6" X 3.5" SCRUB SPONGE
Imperial 

Dade

Victoria 
Bay Med 

Duty 
7100203125 VB74MSS EA 20  $            17.92 IMPERIAL BAG

B.11
STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBING PADS SCOTCH 

BRITE #84- 49 GRAM MIN
Boardwalk Boardwalk BWKSCRUBBER BWKSCRUBBER EA 72  $            35.00 

CAROLINAS PAPER 
SUPPLY

B.12 BOX OF COTTON T-SHIRT RAGS
Textile Waste 

Supply

Textile 
Waste 
Supply

2190176 TWY2190176 25 LB 1  $            55.53 WB MASON

B.13
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY

C6228B_60 EA Blue 60  $            51.66 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

B.13
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY

C6228G_60 EA Green 60  $            55.21 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

B.13
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY

LEP8251616Y EA Yellow 50  $            53.14 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

B.13
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY

LEP8251616R_50 EA
Red (Pink 
Tone) 50

 $            53.14 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

B.13
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY

LEP8251616KCHP
_200

EA Black  200  $          127.63 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

B.13
WAFFLE WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - AT LEAST 6 ASSORTED 
COLORS - PLEASE SPECIFY

LEP8251616OR_2
00

EA Orange 200  $          137.55 
AGNI - 

HEAD-TO-HEELS

B.15
ODOR ELIMINATING/ DEODORIZING URINAL 

SCREENS, THE WAVE (OR EQUIV), APPLE 
SPICE or MINT PREFERRED

Boardwalk Boardwalk 1001 BWK1001 EA 12  $            11.98 WB MASON

B.16
JANISAN ECO FRESH HANG TAGS W/O 

SUCTION (NO SUBS), APPLE SPICE, MINT, OR 
WINTERGREEN PREFERRED

Fresh 
Products

Janisan
EHT72-CM 
(cucumber-

melon)

HTF012I072M01S
A

EA 12  $            16.50 IMPERIAL BAG

B.17**
ANGLED KITCHEN BROOM 12-15" 

SWEEPING SPAN
Alphapointe

Alphapoint
e

NY-331 EA 6  $            46.92 NYSPSP**

B.17
ANGLED KITCHEN BROOM 12-15" 

SWEEPING SPAN
Boardwalk BWK932A 16587002 EA 1  $               8.56 ARAMSCO

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 4 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.18
LOBBY DUST BROOM 8" SWEEPING PLUS 

DUSTPAN
ABCO

BR-1021MC
DP-00204EH

26485348
26583474

EA 1  $            12.74 ARAMSCO

B.19 WAREHOUSE CORN BROOM Boardwalk Boardwalk BR10012 BWKBR10012 EA 6  $            41.59 WB MASON

B.20
DUSTPAN, METAL JANITOR -HAND HELD, 

10"-12"
Janico 1092 715CNT EA 1  $               5.64 IMPERIAL BAG

B.21 DUSTPAN, PLASTIC JANITOR-HAND HELD Janico 1089 3DSTPAN EA 1  $               2.51 IMPERIAL BAG

B.22
BONA MULTI-SURFACE FLOOR CLEANING 

PADS - 18 DISPOSABLE REFILLS  AX0003641 
(NO SUBS)

Bona AB Bona AX0003641 AX0003641 Box of 18 1  $            24.00 
CAROLINAS PAPER 

SUPPLY

B.23
SWIFFER SWEEPER WET JET MOP REFILL 

CLOTHS PGC95531 (NO SUBS)
Procter & 
Gamble

SWIFFER 95531 PGC08622 72/CS 1  $            29.37 IMPERIAL BAG

B.24
BONA HARD SURFACE FLOOR CLEANER 

LIQUID 2.5 LITER REFILL WM740215021 (NO 
SUBS)

Bona AB Bona WM700017172 WM700017172 GAL 1  $            55.00 
CAROLINAS PAPER 

SUPPLY

B.25
BONA HARD-SURFACE PREMIUM SPRAY 

MOP KIT WM710013571  (NO SUBS)
Bona AB Bona WM710013571 WM710013571 EA 1  $            55.00 

CAROLINAS PAPER 
SUPPLY

B.26
WET MOP HEADS, 5" BAND, LARGE WHITE 
COTTON WITH WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED 

END) STITCHING 32OZ 
ABCO ABCO LM2001XLW ABOLM2001XLW EA 12  $            54.41 WB MASON

B.27
WET MOP HEADS, 5" BAND, LARGE WHITE 
COTTON WITH WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED 

END) STITCHING 24OZ 
ABCO ABCO LM2001LW ABOLM2001LW EA 12  $            39.98 WB MASON

B.28
WET MOP HEADS, 5"BAND MEDIUM WHITE 
COTTON W/WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED END) 

STITCHING 20 OZ  
ABCO ABCO LM2001MW ABOLM2001MW EA 12  $            29.98 WB MASON

B.29
WET MOP HEADS, 5" BAND, SMALL WHITE 

COTTON W/WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED END) 
STITCHING 16 OZ

ABCO ABCO LM2001WN20
ABOLM2001WN2

0
EA 12  $            27.98 WB MASON

B.30 MOP HANDLE,W/SCREW ABCO ABCO 136 BWK136 EA 1  $               4.24 WB MASON

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 5 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.31
WRINGER, 26 QT. PLUS BUCKET METAL 

WRINGER
RUBBERMAID

WAVEBRAK
E

FG748000YEL RUBFG748000YEL EA 1  $            72.89 HILL & MARKES

B.32
INSTITUTIONAL WRINGER PLUS BUCKET, 

PLASTIC WRINGER/STRAINER NO HANDLE
Janico 1016 1016MB EA 1  $          102.88 IMPERIAL BAG

B.33 18" RED BUFF PADS 
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VB18RBFP VB18RBFP EA 5  $            12.75 IMPERIAL BAG

B.34 18" BLACK STRIPPING PAD
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VB18BSTP VB18BSTP EA 5  $            12.75 IMPERIAL BAG

B.36 RED BUFFING PAD 20" Niagara/3M WB Mason 510020WB WBM510020WB EA 5  $            10.89 WB MASON

B.37 BLACK STRIPPING PADS 20" Niagara/3M WB Mason 720020WB WBM720020WB EA 5  $            10.89 WB MASON

B.38 WHITE POLISHING PAD, 20 INCH
HILL & 

MARKES
GENERATI

ON
401220 GNR401220 EA 5  $            16.35 HILL & MARKES

B.39-1
32 OZ Trigger Spray Bottle with Recycled 

Content (Bottle Only) 
IMPACT 

PRODUCTS
IMPACT 5032WG-951 IMP5032WG EA 1  $               0.64 HILL & MARKES

B.39-2 Trigger Mechanism for Spray Bottle 
IMPACT 

PRODUCTS
IMPACT 4902 IMP4902 EA 1  $               0.67 HILL & MARKES

B.43
TRASH LINERS 23X10X39, 33GAL CLEAR 1MIL 

MIN. MIN WGT 21#/CS - ROLLED 
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-231040-
X-Hvy 

INT-231040-X-Hvy 
1 MIL Nominal

INT-231040-X-Hvy EA 250  $            20.32 INTERBORO

B.44
TRASH LINERS 24X24 CLEAR 6 MICRON 

HDPE, MIN WGT 9.1#/CS - ROLLED 
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-2424-L
INT-2424-L        

6 Mic. Noninal
INT-2424-L EA 1,000  $            10.32 INTERBORO

B.45
TRASH LINERS 24X33 CLEAR 10 MICRON 

HDPE - ROLLED
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VBLH243055C VBLH243055C EA 250  $               6.35 IMPERIAL BAG

B.46
TRASH LINERS 33X40 CLEAR 11 MICRON 

HDPE  - ROLLED 
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-3340-
Med

INT-3340-Med     
11 Mic. nominal

INT-3340-Med EA 500  $            20.34 INTERBORO

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 6 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.47
TRASH LINERS 43X48 CLEAR 22 MICRON 

HDPE - ROLLED
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-4348-
XH

INT-4348-XH      
22 Mic. nominal

INT-4348-XH EA 200  $            21.10 INTERBORO

B.48
TRASH LINER 22X16X58 OR 60,2.3 MIL 

CLEAR, MIN WGT 33#/CS - ROLLED 
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-221658-
Super Exh

INT-221658-Super 
Exh              

2.3 MIL nominal

INT-221658-Super 
Exh

EA 100  $            25.15 INTERBORO

B.49
TRASH LINER 22X16X58 OR 60, 2.3 MIL 

BLACK/GREY, MIN WGT 33#/CS - ROLLED 
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-221658-
Super XXH

INT-221658-Super 
XXH              

2.3 MIL Nominal

INT-221658-Super 
XXH

EA 100  $            28.48 INTERBORO

B.50
TRASH BAGS 1 MIL MIN. 23"X20"X46" 

CLEAR, MIN WGT 13#  - ROLLED
IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-232046-
Hvy

INT-232046-Hvy   
1 MIL Nominal

INT-232046-Hvy EA 200  $            21.96 INTERBORO

B.51
PRO103483 VACUUM BAG FOR PROFORCE 

(OR EQUIV)
ProTeam ProTeam PRO103483 16042234 10/PACK 1  $               8.77 ARAMSCO

B.52 PRO107377 VACUUM BAG (OR EQUIV) ProTeam ProTeam PRO107377 PRO107377 10/PACK 1  $            11.38 HILL & MARKES

B.53
TRANSLUCENT CUPS 9 OZ. (BOARDWALK 

POLYPROPYLENE OR EQUIV)
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VBPP9CUP VBPP9CUP EA 2500  $            49.30 IMPERIAL BAG

B.54
PAPER CUPS FOR DISPENSER, EQUIV SIZE 

(for dispenser) of Boardwalk 9 oz 
Polypropylene cups

Chef's Supply
Chef's 
Supply

HCPLA10 CSIHCPLA10 50/PK 20  $            55.98 WB MASON

B.55
HAIR-NETS (BLACK) DISPOSABLE - SINGLE 

USE
HNC 

Enterprises
HC-HNL-BK HAIRNET 144/BOX 1  $               9.00 IMPERIAL BAG

B.56
INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 4OZ PUMP 

BOTTLE
WB Mason WB Mason NWLHS0424 4 OZ 1  $               1.63 WB MASON

B.57
INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 8OZ PUMP 

BOTTLE
WB Mason WB Mason NWLHS0812 8 OZ 1  $               2.06 WB MASON

B.58
ALCOHOL-FREE HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER 

REFILL (MUST FIT CLARIO 91831-92 
DISPENSER) 

Betco
Clairo 

Alcohol-
Free

7522900 75229 1000 ML 6  $            55.20 IMPERIAL BAG

B.59
HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST 

FIT CLARIO 91831-92 DISPENSER) 
Betco Betco BCC79519 BCC79519  800 ML 6  $          143.00 

CAROLINAS PAPER 
SUPPLY

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 7 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.60-1
HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST 

FIT PURELL (FMX-12) GOJ512006 
DISPENSER)

GOJO 
Industries

FMX-12 
Hand 

Sanitizer 
5192-04 519204 1200 ML 4  $            82.28 IMPERIAL BAG

B.60-2
PURELL DISPENSER (FMX-12) (NO SUBS) 

GOJ512006
GOJO 

Industries
Purell GOJ512006 5120-06 EA 1  FREE IMPERIAL BAG

B.61
HAND-SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST 

FIT KUT5666 DISPENSER)
Kutol 5666 16368060  800 ML 12  $            53.75 ARAMSCO

B.62
FOAMING HAND SOAP DISPENSER REFILL 
KUTOL (MUST FIT  KUT69041 DISPENSER)

Kutol 69041 26761282 1000 ML 6  $            42.65 ARAMSCO

B.63
SOAP, LIQUID HAND SOAP DISPENSER 

REFILL KUTOL HEALTH GUARD 7227 (OR 
EQUIV)

KUTOL
KUTOL 

HEALTH 
GUARD

7227 KUT7227 1000 ML 10  $            40.00 HILL & MARKES

B.64 HAND SOAP, LIQUID  1 GALLON KUTOL
KUTOL 

HEALTH 
GUARD

69009 KUT69009 GAL 4  $            38.40 HILL & MARKES

B.65
HEAVY-DUTY ORANGE TRASH BAGS. LOW 
DENSITY PLASTIC, ≥3 MIL, 42-48 GAL, FOR 

ROADSIDE TRASH COLLECTION

IBS/Pit/Glopa
k/Hymopack

INT-4348-   
Super Exh

INT-4348-        
Super Exh         

3Mil Nominal

INT-4348-        
Super Exh

EA 100  $            49.68 INTERBORO

B.66
NITRILE POWDER FREE GLOVES, ≥3 MIL SM-

XL 
Rensow Rensow US5800GGB

US5800GGB   
US5801GGB   
US5802GGB   
US5803GGB

100/BOX 10  $            24.86 UNITED SALES

B.67
NITRILE POWDER FREE GLOVES, ≥6 MIL SM-

XL BLACK only

Automotive 
Service 

Products
WB Mason

P1710    P1711    
P1712   P1713

ATSP1710   
ATSP1711   
ATSP1712   
ATSP1713

100/BOX 1  $               7.60 WB MASON

C.1 FACIAL TISSUE (100 TISSUE/BOX) 8"X8" Santoray Santoray US4211CPGB US4211CPGB 100/BOX 30  $            14.10 UNITED SALES

C.2
TOILET TISSUE ,1 PLY INDIV. WRAPPED 1000 

SHEETS/ROLL, 4-1/2” WIDE ROLLS 
Atlas Atlas US115APM US115APM

1000 
sheets/roll

96  $            41.29 UNITED SALES

Category C:  Janitorial Paper Products

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 8 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

C.3
TOILET TISSUE, 2 PLY INDIV. WRAPPED 500 

SHEETS/ROLL, 4-1/2” WIDE ROLLS 
Atlas Atlas APM248GREEN US4229CPGB

400 
sheets/roll

96  $            27.97 UNITED SALES

C.4
JUMBO TOILET TISSUE, 2 PLY  3.3" CORE, 

3.5"X9" 1000' PER ROLL
Atlas Atlas US700APM US700APM 1000' roll 12  $            26.32 UNITED SALES

C.5
 JUMBO TOILET PAPER, 2-PLY, 1400' L X 3.5" 

x 12" 
Nittany NP-TT2P12 NPTT2P12 1200' roll 6  $            25.00 IMPERIAL BAG

C.7
DISPOSABLE TOILET  SEAT COVERS  IMPACT 

PRODUCTS 25188173 LEVER DISPENSED (NO 
SUBS) 

Impact 
Products 

Impact 
Products 

25188173 16898342 3000/BOX 1  $            55.96 ARAMSCO

C.8
DISPOSABLE TOILET  SEAT COVERS MUST FIT 

IMP 25183273 
Impact 

Products 
Impact 

Products 
25187973 16888341 5000/BOX 1  $            71.74 ARAMSCO

C.9 C' FOLD TOWEL 10 10"X12 3/4" Santoray Santoray US4002G US4002G 200/PACK 12  $            17.10 UNITED SALES

C.10
MULTIFOLD TOWEL WHITE ONLY,  9 1/2" X 9 

1/4"
Santoray Santoray US5301NP US5301NP 250/PACK 16  $            17.83 UNITED SALES

C.11
CASCADES PRO CAS-T115 PERFORM™ 

STANDARD 1-PLY TOWEL ROLL, 775' x 7.5", 
NATURAL (NO SUBS), for electronic 

Cascades Inc. Cascades T115 CSD1358 775 FT 6  $            45.49 WB MASON

C.12
SINGLE ROLL HARDWOUND TOWELS, 

MARCAL PRO MRCP708B, 800' x 7.88" (NO 
SUBS)

Marcal
Marcal 

PRO
MRCP708B MRCP708B 800 FT 6  $            24.50 WB MASON

C.13
DISPENSER FOR SINGLE ROLL, ESSITY 87T 

(OR EQUIV)
GEN GEN 1605 GEN1605 1 1  $            38.24 WB MASON

C.14
KITCHEN ROLL TOWEL 84/RL WHITE, 

11"X8.8" 2 PLY
Marcal Marcal 6350 MRC06350 85 SHT/RL 30  $            23.87 WB MASON

C.15
TORK BASIC PAPER WIPER 192125A (NO 

SUBS)
Essity Tork 192125A 192125A 110/BOX 18  $            35.99 IMPERIAL BAG

C.16
TORK INDUSTRIAL WIPER 440245A (NO 

SUBS)
Essity Tork 440245A 440245A 90/BOX 10  $            50.60 IMPERIAL BAG

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 9 of 10



ULSTER COUNTY UC24-047  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective January 30, 2025 - January 31, 2026) Updated 9/10/2025
Includes suggested NYS Preferred Source Options and GSA Contract items. †PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)
# UNITS 

PER CASE
 †CASE PRICE 
(min. order) 

MANUFAC-
TURER

BRAND 
MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

C.17 TORK PAPER WIPER 303362 (NO SUBS) Essity Tork 303362 303362 125/BOX 8  $            63.86 IMPERIAL BAG

C.18 #8 GROCERY BAGS BROWN
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VB8SOB VB8SOB Bundle 500  $            10.58 IMPERIAL BAG

C.19 #20 TALL BROWN PAPER BAGS
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VB20SOB VB20SOB Bundle 500  $            17.17 IMPERIAL BAG

C.20 #20 TALL WHITE PAPER BAGS
Imperial 

Dade
Victoria 

Bay
VB20SOBW VB20SOBW Bundle 500  $            27.00 IMPERIAL BAG

D.2
LINER FOR SANIT.NAPKIN 

RECEPTACLE,KRAFT,WAXED BAG 7.5”x 
10.25”X3.5"

Hospeco
Health 
Guards

KL 260SANBAG EA 500  $            20.25 IMPERIAL BAG

D.3
 INDIVIDUAL SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL 

BAGS,KRAFT,WAXED BAG 4”x 2.25”X9"
BagCraft BagCraft 72181003149 72181003149 EA 1000  $            57.60 

CAROLINAS PAPER 
SUPPLY

Category D: Feminine Hygiene Products

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 10 of 10
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