
COUNTY OF ULSTER 
JEN METZGER 

County Executive 

 
 
 
 

 

ULSTER COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES 

 

EDWARD M. JORDAN 

Director of General Services 

 

CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION 
 

 

Title: SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 
 

BID NUMBER: RFB-UC25-090 
 

Contract Period: April 1, 2026 – March 31, 2027 
 

Authorized Users: ALL 
 

View Specifications at:  http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/ 

 

 

Submit Inquiries to: 

Name:  Ancolie Martelly, Principal Buyer  
 

Phone: 845-340-3405 
 

Fax: 845-340-3434 
 

Email: anma@ulstercountyny.gov 

 

If you intend to Piggyback off of this bid please contact Buyer first. 

 

 

BID DESCRIPTION 
 

The purpose of this bid is to establish pricing for the purchase of janitorial supplies by various Ulster 
County Departments and others authorized by law.  

 
NYS Preferred Source and GSA options have been provided for items not awarded or when the 
preferred source option meets Preferred Source price standards (up to 15% above the awarded 

vendor price), based on available prices as of January 1, 2025. Preferred Source and GSA options 
are indicated by ** on this list and are not awarded as part of this RFB. For more information about 
use of Preferred Sources go to https://ogs.ny.gov/system/files/documents/2022/09/list-of-preferred-
source-offerings.pdf and https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement/nys-procurement-bulletin-preferred-source-

guidelines. 

 

http://www.empirestatebidsystem.com/
https://ogs.ny.gov/system/files/documents/2022/09/list-of-preferred-source-offerings.pdf
https://ogs.ny.gov/system/files/documents/2022/09/list-of-preferred-source-offerings.pdf
https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement/nys-procurement-bulletin-preferred-source-guidelines
https://ogs.ny.gov/procurement/nys-procurement-bulletin-preferred-source-guidelines


AWARDED SUPPLIERS  
 

 

SUPPLIER 
SUPPLIER 

INFORMATION 
CONTACT INFO 

11400 LLC. 

Contract # B25-090A 

Ly Nguyen  

2551 Horseshoe Road 

Lancaster, PA 17601 

lnguyen@11400llc.com. 

Phone: (717) 392-7429 

ARAMSCO 

Contract #B25-090B 

Deanna McGee – PO’s 

Keith Sult – Bids 

11 Harding St. 

Middletown, NY 10940 

Email: eamorders@aramsco.com 

ksult@aramsco.com    

 Phone: (845) 346-4700      

 Fax: (845) 346-4717     

Central Poly-Bag Corp. 

Contract #B25-090C 

David Freier 

2400 Bedle Place 

Linden, NJ 07036 

Email: bids@centralpoly.com 

 Phone: (908) 862-7570 

Fax: (908) 862-9019 

HILL & MARKES 

Contract #B25-090D 

Angie Richards – sales 

Customer Service - Bids 

1997 State Hwy 

Amsterdam, NY 12010 

Email: arichards@hillnmarkes.com 

info@hillnmarkes.com 

 Phone: (518) 774-4447   

 Fax: (518) 842-1207      

UNITED SALES 

Contract #B25-090E 

Rachel Brach 

5902 14th Ave., Unit 107 

Brooklyn, NY 11219 

Email: csbids@unitedsalesusa.com 

 Phone: (718) 709-5900 

 Fax: (718) 709-7705 

PYRAMID 

Contract #B25-090F 

Bonny Miller 

6510 North 54th Street 

Tampa, Florida 33610 

Email: biddept@pyramidsp.com 

 Phone: (800) 792-2644 

 Fax: (813) 261-7688 

WB MASON 

Contract #B25-090G 

Leanne Wood 

22 Veteran’s Lane 

Plattsburgh, NY 12901 

Email: Leanne.wood@wbmason.com  

Phone: (508) 436-5722 

Fax: (518) 561-4584 

 
 

 

PREFERRED SOURCES and GSA Contractor 
 

 

SUPPLIER 
SUPPLIER 

INFORMATION 
CONTACT INFO 

CORCRAFT CORCRAFT 
www.corcraft.ny.gov 

 Phone: (800) 436-6321 x2605      

 Fax: (518) 436-6007     

NYS PROGRAM FOR 

NEW YORKERS WHO 

ARE BLIND 

NYSPSP 
www.nyspsp.org 

 Phone: (800) 421-9010 

 Fax: (518) 456-3587 

NYS INDUSTRIES FOR 

THE DISABLED 
NYSID 

www.nysid.org 

 Phone: (518) 463-9706 

 Fax: (518) 463-9708 

WEXFORD LABS 

Liz Bouren 

325 Leffingwell Avenue 

Kirkwood, MO 63122 

Email: orders@wexfordlabs.com  

Phone: (314) 966-4134 



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

A.1 WHITE VINEGAR, GALLON 101vingrwhte 1 Gallon 4 11.99$          11400 LLC

A.5 BAKING SODA, 32OZ 22501170 4 lb. 6 29.49$          11401 LLC

A.6
ECOS PRO FURNITURE POLISH, 32 oz Sprayer 

PL9731/6 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO EFPPL97316 32 OZ 6  $            27.90 WB Mason

A.8
ECOS PRO STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER & 

POLISH, 32 oz Sprayer PL9330/6 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9330/6 EFPPL93306 32 OZ 6  $            42.36 WB Mason

A.9
ECOS PRO STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER & 

POLISH, 1 Gal Refill PL9330/04 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9330/04 EFPPL933004 1 GAL 4  $            97.42 WB Mason

A.10
ECOS PRO WHITEBOARD CLEANER, 32 oz 

Spray PL9869/6 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECPS PRO PL9869/6 EFPPL98696 32 OZ 6  $            24.60 WB Mason

A.11
ECOS PRO GLASS CLEANER w/VINEGAR, 32 

oz Spray PL9300/6 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9300/6 EFPPL93006 1 GAL 4  $            20.11 WB Mason

A.12
ECOS PRO GLASS CLEANER w/VINEGAR, 1 

Gal Refill PL9300/04 (NO SUBS)
PL9300/04 324pl930004 1 Gallon 4 54.99$          11400 LLC

A.13

FACILIPRO PEROXIDE GLASS & SURFACE 

CLEANER CONCENTRATE, 1.3L ECO6100608 

(NO SUBS)

Ecolab Facilipro ECO6100608 ECO6100608 1.3 Liter 2  $            38.10 Hill & Markes

A.14

PURELL PROFESSIONAL SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT SPRAY, 

32 oz Sprayer 3342-06 (NO SUBS)

6 - 32oz/CS GOJO Industries 3342-06 GOJ334206 32 OZ 6  $            28.59 WB Mason

A.15

PURELL PROFESSIONAL SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT, 1 Gal Refill 3432-04 (NO 

SUBS)

GOJO 

Industries
Purell 3432-04 GOJ434204 1 GAL 4  $            44.57 WB Mason

A.16
CLOROX ECOCLEAN DISINFECTING CLEANER, 

32 oz Sprayer 60213  (NO SUBS)
CloroxPro EcoClean 60213 CLO60213 32 OZ 9  $            42.68 WB Mason

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 1 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

A.17
CLOROX ECOCLEAN DISINFECTING CLEANER, 

1 Gal Refill 60094 (NO SUBS)
CloroxPro EcoClean 60094 26454811 Gallon 4  $         63.28 Aramsco

A.18
LYSOL HYDROGEN PEROXIDE MULTI-

PURPOSE CLEANER 19200-89289 (NO SUBS) 

Reckitt 

Benckiser 

Group

Lysol 19200-89289 RAC89289CT 32 OZ 9  $            50.06 United Sales

A.19
PURELL PROFESSIONAL FOOD SURFACE RTU 

SPRAY, 32 oz Sprayer  3341-06  (NO SUBS)

GOJO 

Industries
Purell  3341-06 26941637 Quart 6 30.00$          Aramsco

A.20

PURELL PROFESSIONAL FOOD SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT, 1 Gal Refill 4341-04 (NO 

SUBS)

GOJO 

Industries
Purell 4341-04 26720805 Gallon 4 44.48$          14401 LLC

A.21

PURELL HEALTHCARE SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT SPRAY, 32 oz Sprayer 3340-

06  (NO SUBS) 

GOJO 

Industries
Purell 3340-06 GOJ334006CT 32 oz 4  $            44.55 WB Mason

A.21**

PURELL HEALTHCARE SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT SPRAY, 32 oz Sprayer 3340-

06  (NO SUBS) 

GOJO 

Industries
Purell 3340-07 D4098 32 oz 3  $            28.04 NYSID

A.22

PURELL HEALTHCARE SURFACE 

DISINFECTANT SPRAY, 1 Gal Refill 4340-04 

(NO SUBS)

GOJO 

Industries
Purell 4340-04 26961437 Gallon 4  $            70.88 14400 LLC

A.23

FACILIPRO ACID BATHROOM CLEANER 

CONCENTRATE, 1.3L ECO6100300 (NO 

SUBS)

Ecolab FaciliPro ECO6100300 ECO6100300 1.3 Liter 2  $            81.24 Hill & Markes

A.25
CLR PRO CALCIUM, LIME, & RUST REMOVER 

SPRAY BOTTLE, 22 or 32 oz Spray (NO SUBS)
Jelmar CLR PRO

G-FM-CLR32-

6PRO
QT 6  $            41.58 14400 LLC

A.27 URINE DIGESTER AND ODOR NEUTRALIZER
Spartan 

Chemical
X-EFFECT 7319-03 26573903 32 oz 12  $            46.32 Aramsco 

A.28
ECOS PRO TOILET BOWL CLEANER, 24 oz 

Gooseneck PL9703/6 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9703/6 D4510-00QT-000 24 OZ 6  $            22.50 WB Mason

A.29
ECOS PRO DISHMATE MANUAL DISH LIQUID, 

25 oz Squeeze Bottle PL9721/6 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9721/6 D4510-00QT-000 25 OZ 6  $            18.00 WB Mason

A.30
ECOS PRO DISHMATE MANUAL DISH LIQUID, 

1 Gal Bottle PL9721/04 (NO SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9721/04 324pl972104 1 Gallon 4  $         53.49 11400 LLC

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 2 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

A.32

ECOS PRO ALL PURPOSE CLEANER & 

DEGREASER, 32 oz Spray PL9706/6 (NO 

SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9706/6 324pl97066 32 fl. Oz 6 32.99$          14400 LLC

A.33

SIMPLE GREEN INDUSTRIAL CLEANER & 

DEGREASER LEMON SCENT, 24oz SPRAY 

3010001214002 (NO SUBS)

Sunshine 

Makers, Inc.
Simple Green 3010200614010 A55043 24 oz. 12  $            72.24 Aramsco

A.34

SIMPLE GREEN INDUSTRIAL CLEANER & 

DEGREASER LEMON SCENT, 1 GAL 

3010001214002  (NO SUBS)

Sunshine 

Makers, Inc.
Simple Green 3010001214002 28150 Gallon 6  $            79.74 Aramsco

A.35

SIMONIZ GREENSCENE

HEAVY DUTY LIQUID DEGREASER 

CONCENTRATE G1165004 (NO SUBS)

Simoniz USA, 

Inc.
Simoniz G1165004 SMZG1165004 GALLON 4  $            38.86 Hill & Markes

A.36
*CONCENTRATED 1 GALLON CARPET 

DEFOAMER 
20731b6 128 fl. Oz. 1 29.49$          14400 LLC

A.37**
*CONCENTRATED, LOW FOAMING LIQUID 

CARPET  CLEANER
RMC Envirocare D4505 Gallon 4 51.64$          NYSID

A.38

CARPET SPOTTER, DIVERSEY GENERAL 

PURPOSE with PERCOLATOR TECH, 32oz 

101109763 OR EQUIVALENT

Diversey Diversey 101109763 DIV101109763 32oz BOTTLE 12  $            52.42 Hill & Markes

A.40
GS NEUTRAL CLEANER CONCENTRATE, 1 oz 

2384507 (NO SUBS)
Stearns Stearns 2384507 STS2384507 1 OZ 144  $            44.66 WB Mason

A.41
ECOS PRO NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER 1:128 

CONCENTRATE, 1Gal PL9448/04 (NO SUBS)
ECOS PRO ECOS PRO PL9448/04 EFPPL944804 1 GAL 4  $          121.40 WB Mason

A.42

FACILIPRO FLOOR ORANGE CLEANER 

CONCENTRATE, 1.3L ECO6100081 (NO 

SUBS)

EcoLab Facilipro ECO6100081
ECO6100081 1.3 Liter

2  $            64.88 Hill & Markes

A.43-1

CERTIFIED, SUSTAINABLE FLOOR STRIPPER 

(must bid with paired Floor Finish), GAL, e.g. 

ENVIROSOLUTIONS ES85

Charlotte 

Products
Enviro Solution ES85

Gallon 
4 112.29$        

A.43-2

CERTIFIED, SUSTAINABLE FLOOR FINISH 

(must bid with paired Floor Stripper), GAL, 

e.g. ENVIROSOLUTIONS ES98

Charlotte 

Products
Enviro Solution ES98 Gallon 4 112.29$        

Aramsco

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 3 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

A.44

ECOS PRO LIQUID LAUNDRY DETERGENT, 

170 oz or 1 Gal, any scent or Free & Clear 

(NO SUBS)

ECOS PRO ECOS PRO EFPPL937102 170 OZ 2  $            29.00 WB Mason

A.45

ECOS PRO OXOBRITE OXYGENATING 

WHITERNER & BRIGHTENER POWDER, 8.5lb 

PL9892/04 (NO SUBS)

ECOS PRO ECOS PRO PL9892/04 324pl989204 8.5 lb. 4 152.99$        11400 LLC

A.46

OFF! FAMILYCARE UNSCENTED SPRAY 

INSECT REPELLENT, 6 oz Non-Aerosol 

SJN654458 (NO SUBS)

SC Johnson OFF! SJN654458 SJN654458 6 OZ 12  $            75.92 WB Mason

A.47

DISINFECTING WIPES

8.5" x 4.25" CANISTER 

CLOROX ECOCLEAN 75 CT 60605 (NO SUBS)

The Clorox 

Company
Clorox EcoClean 60605 CLO60605CT 75 WIPES 6  $            33.56 United Sales

A.48**

DISINFECTING WIPES

7.5" x 5.5" CANISTER 

WEXFORD PUREFEXION WIPES 160 CT 3230C-

Wexford Labs

Purefexion 

Disinfecting 

Wipes

3230C--160-CS 3230C-160-CS
Canister of 

160
12  $          118.15 

WEXFORD LABS**

GS-07F-057AA

B.1 SQUEEGIE,12" WINDOW
BETTER BRUSH 

#260412 EA
6

 $5.49
Pyramid

B.2 TELESCOPING HANDLE FOR SQUEEGIE
RUBBERMAID 

#FGQ755
EA 6 EA

 $            90.90 
Pyramid

B.3
PUMICE SCOURING STICK WITH HANDLE (for 

toilet and other cleaning)
607tbpumstk 5" x 1 1/4" 6

15.49$            
11400 LLC

B.4
SWIFFER DUSTERS HEAVY DUTY 6 FT. SUPER 

EXTENDER STARTER KIT (NO SUBS) 

Procter & 

Gamble
Swiffer 37000773269 63277326 6' 1

 $            16.99 
11400 LLC

B.5
SWIFFER DUSTERS HEAVY DUTY 6 FT. SUPER 

EXTENDER REFILLS; MUST FIT Swiffer 77326
63299036 1 refill

18  $17.99
11400 LLC

B.6 MEDIUM DUTY SCRUB PADS 9X6 ACS #96-601 (x3) EA 60 EA
 $            19.20 

Pyramid

B.7 HEAVY DUTY SCRUB PADS 9X6 ACS #S86 EA 60 EA
 $            21.00 

Pyramid

Category B: Janitorial Supplies and Equipment

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 4 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.8 MED-HEAVY DUTY 6" X 3.5" SCRUB SPONGE ACS #SC300 EA 40 EA
 $            20.00 

Pyramid

B.9
STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBING PADS SCOTCH 

BRITE #84- 49 GRAM MIN
DISCO INC. DISCO D104 DSCD104 PACK OF 12 1

 $              5.40 
Hill & Markes

B.10** BOX OF "T-SHIRT" RAGS NYSID NYSID D4695-0000-050 D4695-0000-050 50 lb. 1
 $            72.97 

NYSID

B.10 BOX OF "T-SHIRT" RAGS 161nw43pk50 50 lb. 1 Box
128.99$          

11400 LLC

B.11
WAFFLE-WEAVE MICROFIBER CLEANING 

CLOTH 16X16 - SPECIFY AT LEAST 2 COLORS 

MONARCH 

BRANDS

MONARCH 

BRANDS
PNP915104G PNP915104G 1 12

 $            26.27 
United Sales

B.13

ODOR ELIMINATING URINAL SCREENS, 

FRESH PRODUCTS WAVE (NO SUBS), APPLE 

SPICE or MINT

FRESH WAVE 

#WDSHM
EA 10 EA

 $            19.40 
Pyramid

B.14

ECO FRESH HANG TAGS W/O SUCTION (NO 

SUBS), APPLE SPICE, MINT, OR 

WINTERGREEN

FRESH #EHT72 box of 12 6
 $            98.64 

Pyramid

B.15

ECOS PRO ODOR ELIMINATOR SPRAY for 

surface/fabric/air, 32 oz PL9840/6 (NO 

SUBS)

Earth Friendly 

Products
ECOS PRO PL9840/6 EFPPL98406 32 OZ 6

 $            25.20 
WB Mason

B.16
FRESH WAVE ODOR REMOVING SPRAY for 

Surface/Fabric/Air, 24 oz (NO SUBS)

FRESH WAVE 

#SOEQ
32 oz 6 BOTTLES

 $            31.68 
Pyramid

B.18
ANGLED KITCHEN BROOM 12-15" SWEEPING 

SPAN
NEXSTEP

O'CEDAR MAXI 

PLUS
91351-12 OCD9135112 EACH 1

 $              9.65 
Hill & Markes

B.20
WAREHOUSE CORN BROOM BORDWALK 

#BWKBR10012
EA 1

 $            41.94 
Pyramid

B.20**
WAREHOUSE CORN BROOM

Atlas NY-336 EA 12
 $          143.16 

NYSPSP

B.21
DUSTPAN, METAL JANITOR -HAND HELD, 

10"-12"
IMP4212 EA 1

 $              5.53 
WB Mason

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 5 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.22 DUSTPAN, PLASTIC JANITOR-HAND HELD GJO02406 1 EA 1
 $              2.64 

WB Mason

B.25
SWIFFER SWEEPER WET JET MOP REFILL 

CLOTHS PGC95531 (NO SUBS)

Procter & 

Gamble
SWIFFER 95531 PGC08622 1 EA 12

 $              5.15 
WB Mason

B.27

WET MOP HEADS, 5"BAND MEDIUM WHITE 

COTTON W/WASHABLE WEB (LOOPED END) 

STITCHING 20 OZ  

ABOLM2001WN2

4
1 EA 12

 $            32.52 
WB Mason

B.28

WET MOP HEADS, 5"BAND LARGE WHITE 

COTTON W/WASHABLE WEB (CUT END) 

STITCHING 32 OZ  

JSWMP24CEW 1 EA 1
 $              3.10 

WB Mason

B.29
RUBBERMAID MICROFIBER 5" TUBE MOP 

HEAD, MED FGT85206GR00 (NO SUBS)

RUBBERMAID 

#FGT85206GR
EA 1

 $            77.94 
Pyramid

B.30

RUBBERMAID GRIPPER CLAMP-STYLE WET 

MOP HANDLE, ALUMINUM FGH236000000 

(NO SUBS)

Rubbermaid Gripper  FGH236000000 RCPH236 1 EA 1
 $            23.38 

WB Mason

B.31
RUBBERMAID WAVEBRAKE 35QT. WITH 

BUCKET, WRINGER, HANDLE (NO SUBS)
Rubbermaid Wavebrake FG748000YEL RCPFG748000YEL 1 EA 1

 $            76.93 
WB Mason

B.32
INSTITUTIONAL WRINGER PLUS BUCKET, 

PLASTIC WRINGER/STRAINER NO HANDLE
274mopbcktin 35 qt 1

49.99$            
11400 LLC

B.33 18" RED BUFF PADS ACS #51-18 ea 5
12.70$            

Pypramid

B.34 18" BLACK STRIPPING PAD ACS #72-18 EA 5
12.70$            

Pyramid

B.35 18" WHITE POLISHING PAD ACS #41-18 EA 5
12.70$            

Pyramid

B.36 RED BUFFING PAD 20" WBM510020WB 1 EA 5
 $            12.48 

WB Mason

B.37 BLACK STRIPPING PADS 20" WBM720020WB 1 EA 5
 $            12.48 

WB Mason

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 6 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.38 WHITE POLISHING PAD, 20 INCH WBM410020WB 1 EA 5
 $            12.48 

WB Mason

B.39-1
32 OZ Trigger Spray Bottle with Recycled 

Content (Bottle Only) 

HOSPECO 

#5032WG
EA 1 EA

B.39-2 Trigger Mechanism for Spray Bottle 

HOSPECO #4902 

**TRIGGER ONLY, 

NO BOTTLE**

EA 1 EA

B.40
Spout Funnel, 8 oz capacity, aprox 3.5" 

diameter
407sbfnlps8 8 oz., 3.5" 1

 $              0.64 
11400 LLC

B.41

DESKSIDE WASTEBASKET, 28 QT; 

CONTINENTAL COMMERCIAL PRODUCTS 

60% RECYCLED (OR EQUIV)

COCP2818BK 1 EA 1
 $              4.33 

WB Mason

B.42 GARBAGE CAN W/COVER 20 GAL. PLASTIC
COCP2000GRY + 

COCP2001GY
1 EA 1

 $            24.20 
WB Mason

B.43 WASTE RECEPTACLE 55 GAL. PLASTIC COCP5500GRY 1 EA 1
 $            49.25 

WB Mason

B.44
5 WHEEL DOLLY FITS 22-55 GAL CAN, 

RUBBERMAID RUB2640
274tcdolly 1

22.49$            
11400 LLC

B.45
TRASH LINERS 23X10X39, 33GAL CLEAR, MIN 

1MIL  - ROLLED 
Central Poly Central Poly CP231039N1 Case 250

19.99$            
Central Poly

B.46
TRASH LINERS 24X24 CLEAR, MIN 10 

MICRON HDPE - ROLLED 
Central Poly Central Poly CP2424N10 Case 1000

9.99$               
Central Poly

B.47

TRASH LINERS 24X30 CLEAR, MIN 10 

MICRON HDPE - ROLLED - VICTORIA BAY 

VBLH243055C (OR EQUIV)

Central Poly Central Poly CP2430N10 Case 1000
14.99$            

Central Poly

B.48
TRASH LINER 22X16X58 OR 60 GAL, MIN 2.3 

MIL CLEAR - ROLLED 
Central Poly Central Poly CP221660N2.3 Case 100

29.99$            
Central Poly

B.49
TRASH LINER 22X16X58 OR 60 GAL, MIN 2.3 

MIL GRAY - ROLLED 
Central Poly Central Poly CP221660K2.3 Case 100

26.81$            
Central Poly

 $              1.29 

Pyramid

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.
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ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.50
TRASH BAGS 23X20X46 CLEAR, MIN 1 MIL  - 

ROLLED
Central Poly Central Poly CP232046N1 Case 100

10.95$            
Central Poly

B.51

HEAVY-DUTY ORANGE TRASH BAGS. LOW 

DENSITY PLASTIC, 40x48, MIN 4 MIL FOR 

ROADSIDE TRASH

Central Poly Central Poly CP4048O4 Case 100
111.55$          

Central Poly

B.52
PRO103483 VACUUM BAG FOR PROFORCE 

(OR EQUIV)
ProTeam ProTeam PRO103483 26686004 PK 10

 $              5.99 
Aramsco

B.53 PRO107377 VACUUM BAG (OR EQUIV) ProTeam ProTeam PRO107377 PRO107377 EACH 10
 $            14.28 

Cleaning Systems

B.54
TRANSLUCENT CUPS 5 OZ. (BOARDWALK 

POLYPROPYLENE OR EQUIV)
SANTORAY US4002BFGB US4002BFGB 5 OZ 2500

 $            22.50 
United Sales

B.55
TRANSLUCENT CUPS 9 OZ. (BOARDWALK 

POLYPROPYLENE OR EQUIV)
SANTORAY US4002DFGB US4002BFGB 9oz 2500

 $            44.80 
United Sales

B.56 PAPER CUPS 5 oz 760pcc05w Case 300
69.99$            

11400 LLC

B.57
PAPER CUPS FOR DISPENSER, 9 oz SIZE (for 

dispenser) 
DART SOLO R9N-J8000 SLOR9NJ8000 PACK OF 100 20

 $          200.00 
Hill & Markes

B.59**
INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 4OZ PUMP 

BOTTLE

GOJO 

Industries
Purell 9651-24 D4167 4 oz 24

 $            77.18 
NYSID

B.60
INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 8OZ PUMP 

BOTTLE
KUT5619 8 oz 12

 $            37.06 
WB Mason

B.63-1

HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST 

FIT PURELL (FMX-12) GOJ512006 

DISPENSER)

GOJ509104 1200 mL 4
 $            74.88 

B.63-2
PURELL DISPENSER (FMX-12) (NO SUBS) 

GOJ512006

GOJO 

Industries
Purell GOJ512006 GOJ512006 1 EA 1

 $            21.99 

B.64
HAND-SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (MUST 

FIT KUT5666 DISPENSER)
KUTOL KUTOL 5666 KUT5666 800mL 12

 $            54.91 
Hill & Markes

WB Mason

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 8 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

B.65
FOAMING HAND SOAP DISPENSER REFILL 

KUTOL (MUST FIT  KUT69041 DISPENSER)
KUTOL

KUTOL HEALTH 

GUARD
69041 KUT69041 1000mL 6

 $            37.49 
Hill & Markes

B.66
SOAP, LIQUID HAND SOAP DISPENSER REFILL 

KUTOL HEALTH GUARD 7227 (OR EQUIV)
KUTOL Health Guard 69009 16678068 Gallon 4

 $            42.04 
Aramsco

B.67 HAND SOAP, LIQUID  1 GALLON KUTOL
KUTOL HEALTH 

GUARD
69009 KUT69009 1 GALLON 4

 $            34.18 
Hill & Markes

B.68
NITRILE POWDER FREE GLOVES, MIN 3 MIL 

SM-XL 
RENSOW US5802GGB US5802GGB 100 10

 $            28.60 
United Sales

B.69
NITRILE POWDER FREE GLOVES, MIN 6 MIL 

SM-XL BLACK only
Shieldtech Shieldtech DS600-Size

SM-16631780

MD-16641781

LG-16651782

100/bx 10 boxes
 $            76.70 

Aramsco

B.70
BIODEGRADABLE DISPOSABLE GLOVES, 

Equivalent to Nitrile Gloves
394445scase

100 

gloves/box
10

56.49$            
11400 LLC

B.71

HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER REFILL (no 

subs)  Purell Advanced Green Certified 

GOJ416308

GOJ416308 1000 mL 8
 $            92.62 

WB Mason

C.1 FACIAL TISSUES (100 TISSUES/BOX) 8"X8" SANTORAY US4211CPGB US4211CPGB 100 30  $            13.86 Untied Sales

C.2
TOILET TISSUE ,1 PLY INDIV. WRAPPED 1000 

SHEETS/ROLL, 4-1/2” WIDE ROLLS 
ATLAS US115APM US115APM 1000' 96  $            40.78 United Sales

C.3
TOILET TISSUE, 2 PLY INDIV. WRAPPED 500 

SHEETS/ROLL, 4-1/2” WIDE ROLLS 
ATLAS US4229CPGB US4229CPGB 500' 96  $            27.69 Untied Sales

C.4
JUMBO TOILET TISSUE, 2 PLY  3.3" CORE, 

3.5"X9" 1000' PER ROLL
MORM99 1000' RL 12  $            23.17 WB Mason

C.5
 JUMBO TOILET PAPER, 2-PLY, 1400' L X 3.5 

INCH W 
ALLIANCE US062APGB US062APGB 1300' 6  $            24.56 Untied Sales

Category C:  Janitorial Paper Products

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 9 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

C.6
TOILET TISSUE 1-3/4" SPLIT CORE 4.5X4" X 

1500 SHEETS MORCON 1500 (OR EQUIV)
ALIC45851SC 1755 SHT RL 36  $            45.03 WB Mason

C.7

LEVER DISPENSED DISPOSABLE TOILET  SEAT 

COVERS, IMPACT PRODUCTS 25188173  (NO 

SUBS) 

Impact 

Products 
Impact Products 25188173 25188173 cs 3000 Covers $            55.96 Aramsco

C.9 C' FOLD TOWEL 10 10"X12 3/4" Cascades Inc. Cascades H181 CASH181
198 SHEET 

PACK
16  $            20.48 Hill & Markes

C.10
MULTIFOLD TOWEL WHITE ONLY,  9 1/2" X 9 

1/4"
MRCP200B 250 PK 16  $            20.72 WB Mason

C.11

CASCADES PRO CAS-T115 PERFORM™ 

STANDARD 1-PLY TOWEL ROLL, 775 FT L X 7-

1/2 INCH W (NO SUBS)

Cascades Inc. Cascades T115 CAST115 775' ROLL 6  $            42.34 Hill & Markes

C.12
SINGLE ROLL HARDWOUND TOWELS, 

MARCAL PRO MRCP708B (NO SUBS)
Marcal Marcal PRO MRCP708B MRCP708B roll 800ft. 6

26.93$          
Central Poly

C.13
DISPENSER FOR SINGLE ROLL, ESSITY 87T 

(OR EQUIV)
Tork Tork 87T 26921231 ea 1  $            58.47 Aramsco

C.14
KITCHEN ROLL TOWEL 84/RL WHITE, 

11"X8.8" 2 PLY
MRC06350 85 SHT RL 30  $            24.45 WB Mason

C.15
TORK BASIC PAPER WIPER (10.25 x 9 Pop-

Up) 192125A (NO SUBS)
Essity Tork 192125A 26643066 cs 1980 wipes  $            38.12 Aramsco

C.16

TORK PAPER WIPER (4-ply, Nylon 

Reinforced, 16.75 x 9.75 Pop-Up) 303362 

(NO SUBS) 

TRK192127 100 BX 8  $            51.93 WB Mason

C.17
TORK INDUSTRIAL WIPER BLUE (4-ply, 16.5 x 

8.54 Pop-Up) 440245A (NO SUBS)
Essity Tork 440245A 26683161 cs 900 wipes  $            52.45 Aramsco

C.18 #8 GROCERY BAGS BROWN DURO DURO 18408 DUO80984 BALE 500  $            12.21 Hill & Markes

C.19 #20 TALL BROWN PAPER BAGS DURO DURO 18420 DUO18420 BALE 500  $            23.32 Hill & Markes

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 10 of 11



ULSTER COUNTY UC25-090  SUSTAINABLE JANITORIAL SUPPLIES AWARD (Effective April 1,  2026 - March 31, 2027) Prepared 3/26/2026
†PRICES INCLUDE SHIPPING. VENDORS MAY ADD UP TO $5 "SMALL ORDER FEE" IF TOTAL ORDER IS < $40.

Category A: Cleaning, Facility Maintenance Chemicals, Disinfectants, and Sanitizers

*ITEM # DESCRIPTION VENDOR VENDOR SKU
UNIT SIZE 

(e.g., gal., qt.)

# UNITS 

PER CASE

 †CASE PRICE 

(min. order) 

MANUFAC-

TURER
BRAND 

MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

C.20 #20 TALL WHITE PAPER BAGS 433w20bgc 20 lb. 500 bags 49.99$          11400 LLC

D.2

LINER FOR SANIT.NAPKIN RECEPTACLE, 

PAPER, WAXED BAG 7.5”x 10.25”X3.5" (SIZE 

MUST MATCH)

HOSPECO #KL260 EA 500  $            20.00 Pyramid

D.5
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED MAXI PADS, 

FOLDED 
HOSPECO ENVIRO GARDS EGP200 HSPEGP200 CASE 200  $            73.79 Hill & Markes

Category D: Feminine Hygiene Products

     *Item #'s not shown were not awarded. No bid received or items bid did not meet sustainability criteria.

  ** NYS Preferred Source or GSA. For GSA, specify contract number when ordering. 11 of 11
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